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Environmental Sustainability Proposal Rubric 

Category Needs 
Improvement 

Meets 
Expectations 

Exceeds 
Expectations 

1. Statement 
of the 

Problem 

The proposal does not show 
the ability to explain the 
problem, the factors involved 
and why this is an important 
issue. 

The proposal shows some 
ability to explain the problem, 
the factors involved and why 
this is an important issue. 

The proposal shows thorough 
ability to explain the problem, 
the factors involved and why 
this is an important issue. 

2. Report on 
the Problem 

The proposal does not show 
the ability to report on past and 
future attempts to fix the 
problem and their 
effectiveness 

The proposal shows some 
ability to report on past and 
future attempts to fix the 
problem and their 
effectiveness 

The proposal shows thorough 
ability to report on past and 
future attempts to fix the 
problem and their 
effectiveness  

3. List Your 
Goals 

The proposal does not show 
the ability to define achievable 
goals and how they will be 
monitored 

The proposal shows some 
ability to define achievable 
goals and how they will be 
monitored 

The proposal shows thorough 
ability to define achievable 
goals and how they will be 
monitored 

4. Highlight 
Resources 

The proposal does not show 
the ability to define personal 
and local resources which will 
be helpful in solving the 
problem 

The proposal shows some 
ability to define personal and 
local resources which will be 
helpful in solving the problem 

The proposal shows thorough 
ability to define personal and 
local resources which will be 
helpful in solving the problem 

5. Research 
Local 

Partners 

The proposal does not show 
the ability to search for 
community partnerships and 
report on how they can work 
together 

The proposal shows some 
ability to search for community 
partnerships and report on 
how they can work together 

The proposal shows thorough 
ability to search for community 
partnerships and report on 
how they can work together 

 
6. Bibliography 

The proposal does not 
demonstrate the ability to 
perform research 

ü 3 – 5 sources are listed 
ü Sources are mostly listed 

using proper MLA 
formatting 

ü The sources show the 
student has searched for a 
variety of resources 

ü More than 5 sources are 
listed 

ü Sources are listed using 
proper MLA formatting 

ü The sources show the 
student has searched for a 
variety of resources 

 
7. Editing 

The proposal does not 
demonstrate the ability to 
present ideas and information 
in a logical manner. 

ü Correct Tense 
ü Capitalization 
ü Punctuation 
ü Sentences are mostly clear 
ü Incorrect Spelling 
ü Under 5 errors 

ü Correct Tense 
ü Capitalization 
ü Punctuation 
ü Sentences are clear 
ü Correct Spelling 
ü Error Free 


